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Jain Furniture - The Best Furniture Shop in Fatehabad

  Welcome to Jain Furniture, your premier destination for furniture shopping in
Fatehabad, Haryana. Known as the best furniture shop in the area, Jain
Furniture offers an extensive range of high-quality products, ensuring that every
customer finds exactly what they need.  

Wide Variety and Excellent Service Options
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  At Jain Furniture, customers can explore a **huge variety of furniture
products** including the latest models of beds, sofas, and trending items. The
showroom is designed with modern aesthetics, providing a pleasant **in-store
shopping** experience. With a commitment to **nice dealing**, Jain Furniture
prides itself on offering **best prices** without compromising on quality.  

Convenient Payment Methods

  Shopping at Jain Furniture is easy with various **payment options** available.
Customers can make purchases using **credit cards**, **debit cards**, and
even **NFC mobile payments** for added convenience. This flexibility ensures
that you can focus more on finding the perfect piece of furniture rather than
worrying about payment methods.  

Delivery and Service Options

  One of the standout features of Jain Furniture is their prompt delivery service.
They offer **same-day delivery** for many items, catering to customers who
need their new furniture quickly. While most reviews praise the store for its
excellent products and **good quality**, some feedback highlights concerns
regarding service limits. However, the cooperative nature of the owner creates a
welcoming environment for shoppers.  

Planning Your Visit

  A **quick visit** to Jain Furniture will reveal why it is considered one of the best
in Fatehabad. The showroom, which also features a spacious basement for
additional products, is well-organized and easy to navigate. Whether you’re
seeking a new sofa or decorative pieces for your home, Jain Furniture is
equipped to meet your needs.  In conclusion, despite mixed reviews about
service experiences, many customers report positive interactions and
satisfaction with the product quality. Jain Furniture remains a trusted choice for
furniture enthusiasts in Fatehabad, offering excellent value and a wide selection.
   
Our location is in

  
 , 125050  Fatehabad, Haryana - India  (IN) 
 
     
 
The phone number of said Store  is +919467877797
 
And if you want to send a WhatsApp, you can do so at+919467877797
 
    
 
   
    
 

We are open during the following hours:

    Day Hours    

2/10

https://www.openstreetmap.org/directions?to=29.5105301%2C75.44723619999999#map=15/29.5105301/75.44723619999999
tel:+919467877797
https://wa.me/+598+919467877797


Monday 9:30?AM–8?PM   Tuesday 9:30?AM–8?PM   Wednesday 9:30?AM–8?PM   Thursday 9:30?AM–8?PM   Friday 9:30?AM–8?PM   Saturday 9:30?AM–8?PM   Sunday Closed           If necessary to modify any data that you consider is incorrect regarding this
page, please deliver a message so we can we will handle it quickly. Thanks
beforehand thank you very much. 
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