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Shiva G Tech - Hisar
   
Discover Shiva G Tech: Your Go-To Electronics Store in Hisar, Haryana

  Are you looking for a reliable electronics store that caters to all your needs?
Look no further than **Shiva G Tech** in Hisar, Haryana. This store not only
offers a wide range of **electronics** but also prioritizes customer convenience
and inclusivity.  

Amenities and Accessibility

  Shiva G Tech is designed with customer comfort in mind. The store features
**wheelchair-accessible toilets** and **seating**, making it accommodating for
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individuals with disabilities. Additionally, the **gender-neutral toilets** promote
inclusivity for all visitors.  

Service Options and Offerings

  When it comes to **service options**, Shiva G Tech excels by providing
various utilities under one roof. Customers can enjoy **in-store shopping** for
items such as **light bulbs**, **batteries**, and other electronic essentials.  
Moreover, the store offers **repair services** for your devices, ensuring you can
maintain your technology in optimal condition. For those on the go, the
**assembly service** available makes it easy to set up new purchases
efficiently.  

Convenient Payments

  At Shiva G Tech, flexibility in payment options is key. Customers can utilize
**NFC mobile payments** for a seamless checkout experience. Moreover, the
store accepts **credit cards** and other forms of **payments**, catering to
different preferences.  

Quick Visits and In-Store Pickup

  For those with busy schedules, **quick visits** are encouraged. The efficient
layout ensures you can find what you need swiftly. Furthermore, **in-store
pick-up** options are available, allowing for a convenient shopping experience.  

Community Focus

  Shiva G Tech prides itself on being an **LGBTQ+ friendly** establishment,
welcoming all members of the community. The environment fosters inclusivity
and acceptance, making it a safe space for everyone.  

Connectivity and Additional Services

  Stay connected with complimentary **Wi-Fi** available throughout the store.
Whether you're browsing products or checking online services like **money
transfer**, **Bijli Bill Pay**, or **aadhaar linked payment**, you won't miss a
beat.  

Environmentally Friendly Practices

  In addition to offering a myriad of services, Shiva G Tech emphasizes
**recycling**. Customers are encouraged to bring their old electronics for proper
disposal, promoting sustainability within the community.  

Your One-Stop Shop for Electronics

  With an array of **offerings**, from utility services to cutting-edge electronics,
Shiva G Tech truly stands out. Whether you need to apply for a **Rashan card**
or simply wish to shop for the latest gadgets, this store has you covered.   Visit
Shiva G Tech today and experience the ultimate combination of convenience,
inclusivity, and quality service!   
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Our business is located at

  
 Shop No. 1, Millgate Road, near Shiv Mandir, 125001  Hisar, Haryana - India  (IN) 
 
     
 
The contact phone of said Electronics store  is +917988634627
 
And if you want to send a WhatsApp, you can do so at+917988634627
 
    
 
   
    
 

We open at the following schedule:

    Day Hours    Monday 9?AM–9?PM   Tuesday 9?AM–9?PM   Wednesday 9?AM–9?PM   Thursday 9?AM–9?PM   Friday 9?AM–9?PM   Saturday 9?AM–9?PM   Sunday 9?AM–9?PM           If you require to alter any element that you believe is not accurate regarding
this page, we ask forward a message so we can we will adjust it as soon as
possible. In advance we appreciate it. 

Images
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Shiva g tech inside

Shiva g tech hisar
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