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Ocean Computer - Panipat
   
Discover Ocean Computer: A Computer Store in Panipat, Haryana

  Ocean Computer is a notable destination for tech enthusiasts and those
looking for IT infrastructure in Panipat, Haryana. Despite mixed reviews, it
remains a prominent shop for many shoppers.  

Accessibility Features

  One highlight of Ocean Computer is its **wheelchair-accessible entrance**,
ensuring that all customers can access the store comfortably. This commitment
to **accessibility** demonstrates the store's effort to cater to a diverse clientele,

1/9

https://www.tamagna.com/
https://www.tamagna.com/computer-store/panipat/ocean-computer-panipat_298783.php
https://www.tamagna.com/panipat/
https://www.tamagna.com/?src=captcha
https://www.tamagna.com/computer-store/panipat/ocean-computer-panipat_298783.php#com
https://www.tamagna.com/computer-store/panipat/ocean-computer-panipat_298783.php
https://www.tamagna.com/computer-store/panipat/ocean-computer-panipat_298783.php
https://www.tamagna.com/panipat/


making it easier for everyone to explore their products.  

Payment Options Available

  When it comes to transactions, Ocean Computer offers flexibility with various
payment methods. Customers can pay using **debit cards** and **credit
cards**, making purchases convenient and straightforward. This versatility in
**payments** allows shoppers to choose the method that suits them best.  

Customer Experiences

  Customer feedback about Ocean Computer has been quite diverse. Some
have expressed dissatisfaction, claiming, "I do not recommend this seller to
anyone." These individuals reported receiving products that did not match the
promised specifications, describing their experiences as "very disappointing."
They highlighted issues with after-sales support, stating that the owner's primary
focus seemed to be on sales rather than customer care.  On the other hand,
there are positive remarks as well. Many customers noted that it is a "nice place
to buy IT infra," appreciating the variety offered. Descriptors like "Good Shop"
and "Nice person and item price is the best" reflect the satisfaction of some
shoppers regarding product availability and pricing.  

Final Thoughts

  While Ocean Computer in Panipat offers a range of options for technology
enthusiasts, potential customers should weigh both the positive and negative
feedback before making a decision. Accessibility features and flexible payment
methods add to the overall appeal of the store, but caution is advised based on
varying customer experiences.    
We are at

  
 Shop no 5, 132103  Panipat, Haryana - India  (IN) 
 
     
 
The phone number of the mentioned Computer store  is +919896066516
 
And if you want to send a WhatsApp, you can do so at+919896066516
 
    
 
   
    
 

We look forward to seeing you at:

    Day Hours    Monday 9?AM–8?PM   Tuesday 9?AM–8?PM   Wednesday 
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9?AM–8?PM   Thursday 9?AM–8?PM   Friday 9?AM–8?PM   Saturday 9?AM–8?PM   Sunday 9?AM–8?PM           If you need to modify any data that you feel is not precise concerning this
page, we urge you to deliver a message so that we will correct it at the earliest
convenience. Thank you in advance thanks for your cooperation. 
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