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Shubham Computers - Narnaul
   
Discover Shubham Computers in Narnaul, Haryana

  Shubham Computers stands out as a prominent computer store in Narnaul,
offering a wide array of electronics and computer accessories. Customers
frequently mention their experiences, highlighting both the strengths and
weaknesses of this establishment.  

Product Range and Pricing

  While many customers appreciate the availability of all types of computer and
laptop accessories, some reviews suggest that the range of products could
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be improved. Prices at Shubham Computers can be higher than those found
online. For instance, products such as the HP Z3700 mouse are noted to be
available for ?719 online, while sold at ?900 in-store. However, it's also
mentioned that certain laptops are competitively priced, akin to online retailers
like Dell and Amazon.  

Service Options and Staff Experience

  Service options at Shubham Computers receive a mixed response. Many
customers commend the staff for being polite and professional, often describing
the shop as a "hospital for all types of computer diseases." While the service is
generally regarded as good, a few clients have reported negative experiences,
including claims of high charges for minor repairs.  

Payment Methods and Convenience

  Shubham Computers caters to modern payment preferences by accepting 
credit cards and NFC mobile payments, enhancing convenience for
customers. The option for in-store pick-up and same-day delivery also helps
streamline the shopping experience.  

Recycling and Sustainability

  Another noteworthy aspect is Shubham Computers’ commitment to recycling.
They encourage responsible disposal of old electronics, making them a
commendable choice for environmentally conscious consumers.  

Planning Your Visit

  If you're planning a quick visit to Shubham Computers, be prepared for varying
customer experiences. While some rave about the shop’s offerings as "the best
place to buy laptops and computer accessories," others caution potential buyers
about inflated prices.   In summary, Shubham Computers serves as a reliable
resource for your IT needs with a professional staff and a solid selection of
products, despite some concerns regarding pricing and product range. Whether
you're seeking batteries, laptops, or advice, this shop has made its mark in
Narnaul.    
We are at

  
 24X3+3RW, 123001  Narnaul, Haryana - India  (IN) 
 
     
 
The phone number of the respective Computer store  is +919896443323
 
And if you want to send a WhatsApp, you can do so at+919896443323
 
    
 
   
    
 

Our opening hours are:
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    Day Hours    Monday 9?AM–8?PM   Tuesday 9?AM–8?PM   Wednesday 9?AM–8?PM   Thursday 9?AM–8?PM   Friday 9?AM–8?PM   Saturday 9?AM–8?PM   Sunday 9?AM–8?PM           If you wish to change any information that you feel is not correct related to
this web, please forward a message so that we will correct it as soon as
possible. Thanks beforehand thanks for your cooperation. 
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