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Discovering Shiv Computers: A Comprehensive Review

  When searching for a reliable **computer store** in Jagadhri, Haryana, many
customers turn to **Shiv Computers**. However, the experiences shared by
various customers paint a mixed picture of this establishment.  

The Good: Satisfied Customers

  In a sea of reviews, some patrons have expressed their satisfaction with their
purchases. One customer noted, “**Your laptop is very best**,” while another
echoed, “**Your laptop is very nice ?**.” These reviews highlight that for some
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buyers, Shiv Computers has provided quality laptops that meet their
expectations, aligning with their needs and preferences. Furthermore, the
mention of "best laptop" suggests that certain models available at Shiv
Computers do stand out in performance and reliability.  

The Bad: Detractors Share Their Concerns

  Despite the positive feedback, it’s essential to acknowledge the significant
concerns raised by other customers. One user reported a troubling experience
with the laptops they purchased, stating, “**One of the worst experiences I have
with their laptops. I purchased more than 15 laptops and maximum of them got
blast and even they do fake commitments of warranty**.” This alarming
comment raises questions about product safety and the store’s commitment to
quality.  Customers have also described Shiv Computers as a **vendor** that
should not be trusted, emphasizing terms like "**Fake and fraud**." Such
remarks indicate a severe credibility issue that potential buyers should consider
before making purchasing decisions.  

Conclusion: Weighing Your Options

  While Shiv Computers may offer some satisfactory products, the conflicting
reviews signal a need for caution. If you are in the market for a laptop in
Jagadhri, it would be prudent to conduct thorough research, read customer
reviews, and explore alternative options. Always prioritize quality and customer
service to ensure a positive shopping experience.    
You can come to our business at

  
 Hanuman Mandir Mod, Buria chowk, near vridh ashram, 135003  Jagadhri, Haryana - India 
(IN) 
 
     
 
The phone number of this Computer store  is +919355498879
 
And if you want to send a WhatsApp, you can do so at+919355498879
 
    
 
   
    
 

Our opening hours are:

    Day Hours    Monday 9?AM–8?PM   Tuesday 9?AM–8?PM   Wednesday 9?AM–8?PM   Thursday
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