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Sakir Hussain Csc Centre - Firozpur Jhirka, Nuh
   
Exploring Sakir Hussain Csc Centre: A Hub for Eco-Friendly Recycling

  Sakir Hussain Csc Centre, located in Firozpur Jhirka, Nuh Haryana, is not your
average computer store. This center goes beyond the typical retail experience
by focusing on **environmental sustainability** through its recycling initiatives.  

The Importance of Recycling

  Recycling has become increasingly essential in today’s world. At Sakir Hussain
Csc Centre, customers are encouraged to participate in **recycling programs**
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that include various electronic items. The center plays a pivotal role in creating
awareness about the significance of recycling and how it contributes to a
healthier planet.  

Light Bulbs: A Sustainable Choice

  One of the key areas of focus at Sakir Hussain Csc Centre is the recycling of
**light bulbs**. With the rise of energy-efficient lighting solutions, the center
offers customers the opportunity to recycle their old light bulbs responsibly. This
initiative helps reduce hazardous waste and promotes the use of sustainable
lighting options.  

Batteries: Safe Disposal and Recycling

  Another crucial aspect of Sakir Hussain Csc Centre's recycling efforts involves
**batteries**. Many people are unaware of the environmental impact that
improperly discarded batteries can have. The center provides a safe disposal
option, ensuring that batteries are recycled in an environmentally friendly
manner. This commitment to responsible recycling is vital for reducing pollution
and conserving natural resources.  

Community Engagement and Awareness

  The center actively engages with the community, spreading awareness about
the importance of recycling. By offering workshops and informational sessions,
Sakir Hussain Csc Centre empowers residents of Firozpur Jhirka to make
informed choices regarding their electronic waste.  In conclusion, Sakir Hussain
Csc Centre stands out in Firozpur Jhirka as a leader in promoting eco-friendly
practices. Through their dedication to recycling light bulbs and batteries, they
contribute to a more sustainable future while providing valuable services to the
community.    
Our address is

  
 02, Delhi – Alwar Rd, near by Hospital, 122104  Firozpur Jhirka, Nuh, Haryana - India  (IN) 
 
     
 
The contact phone of said Computer store  is +917419348157
 
And if you want to send a WhatsApp, you can do so at+917419348157
 
    
 
   
    
       If necessary to modify any detail that you feel is not precise regarding this web, we ask
send a message and we will correct it as soon as possible. Thanks beforehand we
appreciate it. 
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https://www.openstreetmap.org/directions?to=27.7896024%2C76.9477759#map=15/27.7896024/76.9477759
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Sakir hussain csc centre map
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