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Discover Lappyy: Your Go-To Computer Service in Gurugram, Haryana

  When it comes to reliable computer services, **Lappyy** stands out as a
premier destination in Gurugram, Haryana. With a focus on quality products and
exceptional customer service, Lappyy offers various **service options** tailored
to meet individual and corporate needs.  

Online Appointments: Convenient and Accessible

  Lappyy has embraced the digital age by providing **online appointments** for
customers. This feature allows clients to book consultations and schedule
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services without the hassle of physical visits. Whether you're looking to
purchase a new laptop or need technical support, scheduling an appointment
online saves time and ensures a seamless experience.  

On-Site Services: Expertise at Your Doorstep

  For those who prefer hands-on assistance, Lappyy offers **on-site services**
that bring expert technicians directly to your location. Customers have praised
the prompt response and professional demeanor of the service staff, ensuring
that any issues are resolved efficiently. Whether it's setting up a new laptop or
troubleshooting existing issues, Lappyy's team is committed to providing quick
and effective solutions.  

Service Options Tailored to Your Needs

  At Lappyy, the variety of **service options** is designed with customers in
mind. From selling high-quality refurbished laptops to offering after-sales
support, Lappyy excels in meeting diverse requirements. Many customers noted
the reliability and performance of their purchased devices, with several
highlighting the generous perks such as free bags and mice included with
purchases.  Numerous testimonials convey customer satisfaction:  - "I spoke to
Deepak for weeks before making a purchase, and the entire experience was
seamless." - "The after-sales service is impressive, with quick responses and
assistance when needed."  However, some customers experienced minor
delays in delivery, but the quality of the products often overshadowed these
concerns. Many stated that even if delivery was late, the laptops they received
performed exceptionally well, showcasing Lappyy’s commitment to quality.  

Why Choose Lappyy for Your Computer Needs?

  1. **Excellent After-Sales Support:** Customers consistently praise Lappyy for
their proactive and helpful after-sales service.  2. **Quality Products:**
Refurbished laptops from Lappyy come highly recommended, with many clients
reporting no issues even months after purchase.  3. **Friendly and
Knowledgeable Staff:** Reviews highlight the expertise of Lappyy's team
members, particularly Deepak and Kaushal, who help guide clients in choosing
the right products for their needs.  4. **Convenience Factor:** The option for
online appointments and on-site services makes Lappyy a convenient solution
for busy professionals.  In conclusion, Lappyy is more than just a computer
service; it is a trusted partner for anyone looking to enhance their computing
experience in Gurugram, Haryana. With a robust selection of laptops, exemplary
customer service, and tailored service options, it is clear why Lappyy is highly
recommended by its clients. If you’re in the market for a new laptop or require
technical support, visit Lappyy and experience the difference today!    
The address of our establishment is
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 B 38, Sunder Singh Marg, 122001  Gurugram, Haryana - India  (IN) 
 
     
 
The phone of said Computer service  is +919624010875
 
And if you want to send a WhatsApp, you can do so at+919624010875
 
    
 
   
    
 

Our public attention hours are:

    Day Hours    Monday 8?AM–9?PM   Tuesday 8?AM–9?PM   Wednesday 8?AM–9:30?PM   Thursday 8?AM–9?PM   Friday 8?AM–9?PM   Saturday 8?AM–9?PM   Sunday 8?AM–9?PM        The website is Lappyy       If you wish to update any detail that you consider is not precise regarding
this portal, we kindly request send us a message so that we will fix it at the
earliest convenience. Thank you in advance thanks. 
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