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The mobile shop - Kharkhoda
   
Discover The Mobile Shop in Kharkhoda, Haryana

  The Mobile Shop located in Kharkhoda, Haryana, stands out as a premier
destination for all your mobile needs. With an extensive selection of
**smartphones** and accessories at competitive prices, this store has quickly
become a local favorite.   

Same-Day Delivery Services

  One of the standout features of The Mobile Shop is its commitment to
**same-day delivery**. Customers can enjoy the convenience of receiving their
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purchases on the very same day, making it an ideal choice for those in a hurry.  

Amenities That Enhance Your Shopping Experience

  The store is designed with customer comfort in mind. It offers amenities
including **Wi-Fi** for shoppers to browse online while they shop. Additionally,
The Mobile Shop is **LGBTQ+ friendly**, creating an inclusive environment for
everyone.  

Accessibility Features

  The Mobile Shop prioritizes accessibility for all customers. With a
**wheelchair-accessible car park**, **wheelchair-accessible seating**, and a
**wheelchair-accessible toilet**, everyone can enjoy a hassle-free shopping
experience.   

Modern Payment Options

  Convenience extends to payment methods as well. The Mobile Shop accepts
various **payment options**, including **debit cards** and **NFC mobile
payments** via platforms like **Google Pay**. This flexibility caters to different
customer preferences, making transactions quick and easy.  

Repair Services and Product Offerings

  In addition to selling phones, The Mobile Shop provides essential **repair
services** that ensure your devices are always in top condition. Customers have
noted the availability of all kinds of accessories and superior protective gear,
such as glasses and covers.  

Why Choose The Mobile Shop?

  Customer reviews highlight the positive experiences many shoppers have had
at The Mobile Shop. Phrases like "amazing shopping experience," "fast
service," and "great prices" frequently pop up, emphasizing the quality and
value provided.   Whether you're planning to buy the latest model or simply
need some accessories, The Mobile Shop promises a **quick visit** that leaves
you satisfied. With a friendly staff dedicated to excellent service, it's clear why
this store is recommended by so many.   Visit The Mobile Shop today and
experience unparalleled service and offerings in the heart of Kharkhoda!    
You can visit us at the address:

  
 Delhi Rd, opposite Gupta hardware, 131402  Kharkhoda, Haryana - India  (IN) 
 
     
 
The contact line of the respective Cell phone store  is +918287683091
 
And if you want to send a WhatsApp, you can do so at+918287683091
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https://www.openstreetmap.org/directions?to=28.8754539%2C76.91291489999999#map=15/28.8754539/76.91291489999999
tel:+918287683091
https://wa.me/+598+918287683091


Our business hours are:

    Day Hours    Monday 8?AM–9?PM   Tuesday 8?AM–9?PM   Wednesday 8?AM–9?PM   Thursday 9?AM–8?PM   Friday 8?AM–9?PM   Saturday 8?AM–9?PM   Sunday 8?AM–9?PM           In case you want to alter any information that you think is not precise about
this web, please send us a message so that we will fix it quickly. Thank you in
advance thank you very much. 
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